
CS Team Lead

SAIC Pittsburgh Lead Agent
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You further noted that the local police sniper team declined your offer to “co-locate” with 
either Hercules 1 or 2, and you informed your supervisor of its decision.  You explained 
that standard protocol required local sniper and counter sniper teams to co-locate with 
Secret Service CS Teams on Presidential Protective Division (PPD) advances to facilitate 
communication between the teams.  However, you stated that you did not press the issue 
because this was not a typical PPD advance, and you were concerned about upsetting our 
local law enforcement partners. 
 
Although you expressed confidence in the local sniper team’s capability and its 
contribution to the overall protective mission and thought tha  it could cover the portion of 
the AGR building’s roof behind the arch, you admitted that your primary concern was 
having Hercules 1 or 2 identify the local snipers as a threat and accidently firing on them.  
So, while you thought that they could, or would, cover the portion of the AGR building’s 
roof that sat behind the roof’s arch, you never verified that this was th  case. 
 
Regarding the specification of Failure to Establish Effective Communications with Local 
Snipers, you acknowledged that the lo al snipers offered you radios for the Hercules 
Teams, and you agreed to retrieve them.  However, as yo  were heading to do so, you 
received a radio transmission indicating that then former President of the United States 
(POTUS) Donald J. Trump was already en route to the site.  Although you admitted that 
you could have assigned getting the radios to another Secret Service employee, you did not 
do so.  Rather, you chose to take up your position with Hercules 1.  Thus, you noted that 
the radios were never collected, and you used your cell phone to communicate with the 
local snipers. 
 
You stated that the shortened advance notice and your inability to attend the initial police 
briefings impacted your ability to convince the local police to co-locate with your teams.  
You argued that you are not at fault for the lack of response from the local police partners 
posted in or around the AGR building.  You further alleged that it was reasonable for you 
to believe that those officers would appropriately address any issues that arose during the 
event.   
 
Based on the above, you claimed that you were not negligent in performing your duties.  
However, you also admitted that you could have performed your role in a more effective 
mann r.  Specifically, you admitted that, in hindsight, it would have been simple for you to 
have another employee pick up the radios from the local counter sniper team, that you  
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should have raised the co-location discussion up your chain of command, and that you 
should have communicated to others when you learned of a suspicious individual.  You 
took responsibility for your actions and apologized for your role in the events of July 13, 
2024.  
 
The evidence shows that Thomas Matthew Crooks circumnavigated site security at
POTUS Trump’s campaign rally in Butler, PA, on July 13, 2024, and a tempted to 
assassinate POTUS Trump.  The attempted assassination resulted in the death of Corey 
Comperatore, and David Dutch, James Copenhaver, and POTUS Trump were injured.  
You were the CS Advance for the rally and ultimately responsible for, among other things, 
evaluating areas of vulnerability and working with the local nipers to ensure all long-
distance threats were addressed and quick, efficient communications were established 
between the teams.  You failed to do this.  Thus, I find that the evidence sufficiently shows 
that you negligently performed your duties as the CS Advance. 
 

3. I find that there was a nexus between your actions referenced in the proposed suspension 
and the efficiency of the service.  There is a clear and direct relationship between the 
grounds for the charge and your abili y to accomplish yo r law enforcement duties in a 
satisfactory manner.  Your negligence adversely affects the agency’s trust and confidence 
in your job performance and adversely affected the mission of the Secret Service. 
 

4. In reaching my decision, I have considered the factors set out in Douglas v. Veterans 
Administration, 5 M S.P.B. 313; 5 M.S.P R. 280 (April 10, 1981) (Douglas Factors) and 
the Secret Service Table of Penalties (TOP) as guidance.  
 
The TOP provides that the Deciding Official will consider any mitigating or aggravating 
factors.  A finding that aggravating factors exist will yield a higher penalty; a finding that 
mitigating factors exist will yield a lower penalty.
 
The offense of “Negligence in Performance of Official Duties,” Offense Code 1.8, 
provides for a standard penalty of a five-day suspension, a mitigated penalty of a letter of 
reprimand to a three-day suspension, and an aggravated penalty of a seven-day to a twenty-
one-day suspension.  The aggravating factor for Offense Code 1.8 of “disruption to the 
mission” is applicable in this situation.  The mitigating factors listed under the TOP 
P nal y Gu delines for Offense Code 1.8 do not apply in this situation. 

 
With regard to the Douglas Factors, I have considered the nature and seriousness of the 
offense and its relation to your duties, position, and responsibilities, and the clarity with 
which you were on notice of any rules that were violated in committing the offense.  I have 
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considered that you did not fully address line-of-sight threats, which the shooter ultimately 
took advantage of in carrying out this heinous act.  I have further considered that you could 
have easily assigned the duty of picking up radios that would have facilitated 
communications with the local snipers to another Secret Service employee, but that you 
did not.  I have considered too that you did not pass relevant information to the security 
room, CS Response, Lead Advance, and Site Advance because you assumed someone else 
would do so.  I have considered as well that this incident, which resulted in death and 
injury, received world-wide media coverage that negatively affected this agency’s 
reputation and eroded confidence in our ability to execute ur core mission. 

I have also considered that, as a law enforcement officer, you are held to a highe  standard 
of conduct than other Federal employees; your ten (10) years of service with this agency, 
including the approximately two (2) years you served in the Uniformed Division’s White 
House Branch; and the eight (8) years you have been assigned to he Counter Sniper 
Program, during which you have completed approximately ten (10) to fifteen (15) CS 
advances.  This level of experience indicates to me that you knew, or should have known, 
how to successfully carry out your duties as the CS advance   

In mitigation I have considered your ten (10) years of service with this agency, with no 
prior disciplinary actions.  I have also considered your performance ratings of Exceeds 
Expectations for the previous three rating cycles. I have further taken into consideration it 
was not the negligence of just one employee that led to this unwanted outcome.  In 
addition, I have strongly considered that it was your CS position that ultimately neutralized 
the threat, ending all hostile actions   I have also strongly considered that you have taken 
responsibility for your actions and identified key steps that you could have taken that may 
have prevented this unwanted outcome.  

In balancing the above factors against the nature and seriousness of the offense, I find it 
appropriate to mitigate the proposed fifty-two (52) calendar day suspension to a thirty-five 
(35) calendar day suspension.  Therefore, you will be suspended from duty without pay for
thirty-five (35) calendar days on dates to be determined by your office.  You are also
reminded that employees are not eligible to work overtime in the pay period in which they
are suspended in accordance with the Office of the Director Manual, ITG-06(05).
This action promotes the efficiency of the Federal service.

5. You have the right to appeal this decision to the Merit Systems Protection Board (MSPB)
under 5 U.S.C. § 7701.  You may file an appeal by sending it to the MSPB, Washington
DC Regional Office, 1901 S. Bell Street, Suite 950, Arlington, VA 22202, or by electronic
filing by using “e-Appeal,” an interactive application available on the MSPB website at
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https://e-appeal.mspb.gov/.  If you wish to appeal this decision, you may file such an 
appeal no later than thirty (30) calendar days after the effective date of this action, or no 
later than thirty (30) calendar days after the date of your receipt of this decision, whichever 
is later.  If you do not submit an appeal within this time period, your appeal will be 
dismissed as untimely filed unless a good reason for the delay is shown; the judge will 
provide you an opportunity to show why your appeal should no  be dismissed as untimely   
Appeals submitted by traditional means must be in writing and contain all the information 
specified in the MSPB regulations (the MSPB’s Appeal Form and regulations are available 
on the MSPB website at https://www.mspb.gov/appeals/appeals.htm).  You must follow 
the instructions on e-Appeal for electronic appeals.

6. Under Secret Service policy, you may elect to waive your rights to file a MSPB appeal
under 5 U.S.C. § 7701 and request administrative review of this decision by filing an
administrative grievance with the Secret Service’s Discipline Review Board (DRB) as
specified in the Office of the Director Manual, ITG-06(05).  In your grievance, you must
specifically state that you are waiving your MSPB appeal rights.   You should present your
grievance in writing on the attached Secret Service Administrative Grievance Form, SSF
3112.  You may email your grievance to the Office of In egrity at

  The Office of In egrity will refer your grievance to the
DRB.  If you wish to file a grievance, it must be submitted to the Office of Integrity no
later than fifteen (15) calendar days after the date of your receipt of this decision.

7. If you feel this action is being taken based on reprisal for whistleblowing or other protected
activities, you have th  right to either: 1) to file an appeal of this decision to the MSPB
under 5 U.S.C. § 7701 as referenced above and include such a claim in your appeal, or 2)
seek corrective action under subchapters II and III of 5 U.S.C. chapter 12 by filing a
complaint with the U.S. Offi e of Special Counsel (OSC) at www.osc.gov, but not both.
However, a complaint filed with OSC can be followed by an Individual Right of Action
(IRA) appeal to the MSPB.  In an IRA appeal, the MSPB will be limited to considering the
issues outlined in 5 U.S C. § 1221(e), i.e., whether you have demonstrated that
whistleblowing or other protected activity was a contributing factor in a covered personnel
action and, if so, whether the agency has demonstrated that it would have taken the same
personnel action in the absence of the whistleblowing or protected activity.  If you file a
complaint with OSC prior to filing an appeal to the MSPB, you have elected corrective
a tion under subchapters II and III of 5 U.S.C. chapter 12, and as such, any appeal to the
MSPB would be limited to an IRA appeal, resolving only claims of reprisal for
whistleblowing or other protected activities.
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